
 
 
 

Stratford Chefs School presents: Long Table Dinner - Sunday, September 10th 
 
August 18, 2017, Stratford, ON 
 
Stratford Chefs School’s signature fundraising event Long Table Dinner returns this 
September! 

On Sunday, September 10th, Stratford Chefs School will host an exceptional outdoor 
dining experience at an historic Stratford location.  Guests will gather around one long 

beautifully appointed table to enjoy a four-course dinner of incredible local food and 
complemented by wine from acclaimed Canadian winery Cave Spring Cellars.  

Inspired by “Diner en Blanc”, guests are encouraged to dress all in white and experience 
the beauty of the city while participating in the unexpected.  

A fundraising event, Long Table Dinner helps Stratford Chefs School raise the resources 
required to support student enrichment programs, such as the International Chef in 
Residence; a program that brings cutting edge chefs from around the world to the 
School, offering students the opportunity to experience culinary innovation and to make 
international connections. These programs distinguish the quality of education and 
training Stratford Chefs School students receive. 

The Long Table Dinner is more than an important fundraising event for the School, 
however. It is also a beloved “friend-raising” event; a chance to enrich our support base 
by attracting new people to experience the School in action and increasing our visibility 
in Stratford and surrounding communities..   

We look forward to welcoming you to this extraordinary Stratford Chefs School 
experience.  Tickets are $125 per person. Each ticket will receive a $50 charitable tax 
receipt.  

Tickets are available through the Stratford Chefs School’s website: 
www.stratfordchef.com 

For more information please call 519.271.1414.  
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Long Table Dinner details: 

 
Location to be announced (that’s part of the fun!) 
 
5:15pm Cocktails 

6:00pm Dinner 

White Casually Elegant Attire 

$125 per person (includes all beverages and taxes) 

Seating is limited. 

If rain is expected, the event will be moved to an indoor venue that also holds great 
historic significance in Stratford.  

Images and interviews are available. 

 

About Stratford Chefs School 
 
Nestled in the heart of Stratford, Ontario, the Stratford Chefs School is a not-for-profit 
career college focused on the innovative, hands-on training of high quality, aspiring 
chefs and culinary entrepreneurs. Since 1983 the School has helped to set the standard 
for excellence in culinary training in Canada, and produced over 750 graduates who 
contribute to the development of a distinctive Canadian cuisine. 
 
For more information on the Stratford Chefs School, please contact Executive Director 
Kim Cosgrove at 519-271-1414 or kcosgrove@stratfordchef.com 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Stratford Chefs School | Administration | 192 Ontario Street, Stratford, Ontario N5A 3H4 

Stratford Chefs School | Kitchens and Dinners | 136 Ontario Street, Stratford, Ontario N5A 7Y4 

 


